Name

Payne and Dolan, Inc.
Rieth-Riley
Pyramind Paving Co.

Bolen Asphalt Paving Inc.

Bids awarded to Rieth-Riley
04/15/2010

13A
non-recycled

no bid
$ 52.50
$ 54.75
$ 48.30

Local
13A
15% max recycled

$ 51.50

$ 46.00

$ 50.30
no bid

Utlra Thin

$
$
$
$

HMA

62.00

55.00

57.06

53.35

Non-recycled

$

$

no bid

52.50

51.64

48.30

Primary

15% max recycled

$
$
$

no bid

51.00

46.00

47.08



